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Online CPD Colendor 2025/26

We offer monthly, bite-sized online professional development events tailored for school leaders and teachers. Some of these events are free
for all school staff only, while others are available specifically only as part of our Leadership Hub subscription, or upon payment upon joining.
You can also obtain these events via a one-off payment. However, members get more!

For Members:

Log in to your Leadership Hub dashboard, then go to “Upcoming Events” under the Short Courses section.

For Non-Members:

Visit the Forthcoming Events page on the Veema website.

Webinars now follow themed strands, with follow-up videos available exclusively to members.

+ Short courses are included in our subscription packages (Visionary & Aspire only) at no additional cost.

*  You can still join as a non-member, but please note that priority is given to members when booking these courses.
« Short courses come with CPD-certified certificates.

« Our live Sofa Conversations are open to both members and non-members, although some sessions are exclusive to members. They
provide an opportunity to ask questions, share challenges, and receive practical support.
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What can be expected from these sessions:

Practical ideas and strategies you can use immediately

Handy resources to support staff training and meetings

A taste of what Veema provides and the range of personalised training and support we offer schools

A chance to learn and connect with subject specialists, school leaders, and teachers worldwide

A CPD certificate for attending an online short course of 2 hours or more (please note: certificates are not issued for webinars)

Please note that we will update our online sessions throughout the academic year; therefore, this document may be revised accordingly.
For the most up-to-date information on all our CPD events, please visit our website and follow us on social media channels. This is a live
document that is frequently updated.

Got questions? We'd love to help—drop us a message at cpd@veema.co.uk.

Curious about our membership? Come and see what's waiting for you at the Leadership Hub and discover how Veema can support your
school’s professional learning journey.
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On-

Demand :
. T f . Tim K :
CPD Sessions ypeo Webinar, s (U. ) & Presenter Audience
Session : Duration
Videos &
Resources
Leadership For School
Policy ready for 2025: What v g Leaders,
schools must have and @ Live Webinar Tuesday, 26 3:30 pm . 4:00 Dr Julia Batters Governors, Free
when to review them (Members August 2025 pm (UK time) Boards of
only) Governors, and
School Owners
Leadership For Middle
. . . /
From Teacher to Leader— P&Q'gld(l glps. Pre-recorded Costa Leaders, Members onl
Building confidence in your ractical 1ips (Members Constantinou Academic & 4
That Stick only)
new role Pastoral
From Middle Leader to
Senior Leader—Preparing & Quick Clips: v/
’ Sharon For Senior
for Whole-School Impact Practical Tips (Members
. , Pre-recorded Hennam-Dale Leaders
& On-Demand Video That Stick only)
(Members Only)
For Senior
A School Leader’s Guide to & Quick Clips: / Costa Leaders,
i i Pre- Middle L M /
Leading CPD Pract|cgl Tips (Members re-recorded Constantinou iddle 'eaders, embers Only
That Stick only) Academic &
Pastoral
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On-

Demand :
. 1) f o Tim K .
CPD Sessions ype o Webinar, = (U. )& Presenter Audience
Session : Duration
Videos &
Resources
Free for
Members
v Non-Members
A survival guide for middle Wednesday, 1:30-3:30 For Heads of )
. (Members . . Prices:

leaders: Calm, Clarity & & Short Course only) 3 September pm (UK time) Dr Julia Batters Department and

Confidence Y 2025 Duration: 2 Heads of Faculty £482.20 (standard 5
participants)
£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)
Free for
Members

4
The Brilliant Head of Year: Thursday, 4 8:30am -10:30 For Heads of Non-Members
Building relationships & Short Course (Members September am (UK time) Costa Year, Pastoral
) ! On/}/) Constantinou ! £482.20 (standard 5

routines, and results 2025 Duration: 2 hours Leaders participants)
£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)
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CPD Sessions

Type of

Session

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Dates

Time (UK) &
Duration

Presenter

Audience

Mentoring New Teachers in
International Schools

& Short Course

v

(Members
only)

Friday 5
September
2025

1:30-3:30 pm
(UK time)

Duration: 2 hours

Lisa Jane Ashes

For ECT Mentors,
Heads of
Department,
Subject

Leads, Lead
Practitioners

Free for
Members

Non-Members
Prices:

£482.20 (standard 5

participants)

£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)

Never Stop Lea
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On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Time (UK) &
Duration

Type of

CPD Sessions Presenter Audience

Session

Teaching and Learning
Teaching That Sticks:
What Really Works in the
Classroom and Why
(Free Webinar)

& 0on-Demand Video
Series (Members Only)

Video 1: Assessment
for Learning: Checking
Understanding and Moving

Learning Forward For all teachers,

especially ECT

i . i On-Demand
Video 2: Engaging @ Live Webinar 4 Tuesday, 16 Mentors, Heads & .
Passive L - Reignit 3:30-4:00 pm Video Series

assive Learners: Reignite plus on- (Members September (UK time) Isabella Wallace of Department, (Members Only)
Participation and Focus demand videos only) 2025 Subject Leads, 87
Video 3: Asking Better and Lead
Questions: Strategies Practitioners.

from Rosenshine and
Sherrington.

Video 4: Teach Everyone,
Stretch Everyone: Adaptive
Teaching That Works

Video 5: Marking That
Matters: Making Feedback
Clear, Focused, and
Actionable
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On-

Demand :
: T f : Tim K .
CPD Sessions ypeo Webinar, s (U. = Presenter Audience
Session Videos & Duration
Resources
F .
Sofa Conversations: v Thursdav. 18 Costa Lz;j:gor
A Live Q&A for School ®Live Se temgt;r 3:30 pm - 4:00 Costantinou, Middle I:eaders Free
Leaders to Ask, Share, and | Broadcast (Members P pm (UK time) Judith Green, . '
Cmin el only) 2025 Academic &
Connect - Join us! lan Curry
Pastoral
Free for
Members
. . FOI’ SChOO| Non_Members
;iigljnri:gitl?t : Governance / Tuesday, 23 3:30 - 5:30 pm Governors, ices:
for Internatio);{al school & short Course (Members September (UKtime) Judith Green Boards of Prices:
Boards and Owners On/y) 2025 Duration: 2 hours GOVGI’I’]OI’S, and £482.20 (standard 5
School Owners participants)
£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)
Members:
£422.10
(Plus one free
Advancing Teachers Costa place with every 5
Programme - Helping &0 Week Tuesday, 14 TBC Constantinou & Newly Appointed participants booked
Teachers to Thrive (9-Week | Programme October 2025 . Teachers on this course)
Lisa Jane Ashes
Programme) Non-Members:
£469.00
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CPD Sessions

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Type of

: Dates
Session

Time (UK) &
Duration

Presenter

Audience

Behaviour Management
Understanding and
Supporting Behaviour in
Pupils with SEND

(free webinar)

% 0n-Demand Video

Series (Members Only) , g Nina Jackson Free
Video 1: Managing Low- ® Live Webinar Tuesday, 11 3:30-4:00 pm . For SENCOS, all £ 0on-Demand
. o plus on- (Members November . Nina Jackson
Level Disruption in the , (UK time) teachers, and Video Series
. demand videos only) 2025
Primary Classroom TAs. (Members Only)

Video 2: Tackling Low-
Level Disruption in
Secondary Schools

Video 3: Behaviour
Routines That Support
Learning
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CPD Sessions

Type of

Session

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Time (UK) &
Duration

Presenter

Audience

Part 1:

Wednesday,
26 November

Part 1 & Part 2:
08:30-10:00 am

Members:

£433.98 (standard 5
participants)

‘ N . 2025 (UK time) £764.64 (Premium
Teaching RSA and Sensitive OR 1:30 - 3:00 For PSHE 10 participants)
Topics with Confidence in & Short Course (Members Part 2: , John Rees Leaders, teachers

pm (UK time) Non-Members
Secondary Schools only) Thursday 27 of PSHE
November Total Duration: 3 £482.20 (standard 5
hours participants)
2025
£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)
Members:
Part 1: Part 1 & Part 2: £433.98 (standard 5
participants)
Friday, 28 08:30 - 10:00 am

. N November (UK time) £764.64
Teac_:hmg_ RSA anfj Sen5|F|ve 2025 OR 1:30 - 3:00 pm For PSHE (Premium 10
Topics with Confidence in & Short Course ) John Rees Leaders, teachers | participants)

. Part 2: (UK time)
Prlmary SChOOIS : Of PSHE Non_Members
Tuesday 2 Total Duration: £482.20 (standard 5
December 3 hours participants)
2025

£849.60 (Premium
10 participants)
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On-

Demand :
: 1) f . Tim K .
CPD Sessions ype o Webinar, s (U. )& Presenter Audience
Session : Duration
Videos &
Resources
Sofa Conversations: v/
i @Live i
A L|ve.Q&A for DSLs and (Members Tuesday 9 3:30 pm - 4:00 lan Curry, I?ebble For DSLS, DDSLS,
Inclusion Leaders to Ask, Broadcast December, ) Innes-Turnill, ) Free
. only) pm (UK time) Inclusion leaders
Share, and Connect - Join Not recorded 2025 John Rees
us!
Sofa Conversations: y
ALi A M i )
ive Q&A on Managing @Live Thursday 11 Costa .
Underperformance (Members 3:30 pm-4:00 ) For senior and
. . Broadcast December, ) Constantinou & . Members Only
and Having Difficult only) 2025 pm (UK time) Judith Green middle leaders
Conversations - Join us to Not recorded
Ask, Share, and Connect
/ veema:
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CPD Sessions

Spring Term

Teaching and Learning:
Teaching Phonics and

Early Literacy Skills for EAL
Learners

Type of
Session

@ Live Webinar

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

v

(Members only)

Dates

Tuesday, 13
January 2026

Time (UK) &
Duration

3:30 pm - 3:45 pm
(UK time)

Presenter

Jacqueline Harris

Audience

Literacy

and phonics
coordinators, all
EYFS & primary
school teachers

Part 1:
15-minute open
session

(free for all)

Part 2:
25-minute follow-
on sessions
(members-only)

Senior Leaders,

Standard Package

Safeguarding Designated
Hiring with Confidence: 1:30 - 3:30 pm (UK Safeguarding Z’;Z;g;tbs%fsmﬁ
; Wednesday, 21 ’ .
Safer Recruitment for €. Short Course Y Time) Beth Davies Leads (DSLs), .
International Settings January 2026 Duration: 2 hours Governors, School | Premium Package
.. ’ d Up to 10 members of staff
(Refresher Training) Owners, and HR £977.04 + VAT
Professionals '
Never Stop Learning vezn la/
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https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/teaching-and-learning-teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners-part-2/
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https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/teaching-and-learning-teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners-part-2/
https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/teaching-and-learning-teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners-part-2/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/safeguarding-hiring-with-confidence-safer-recruitment-for-international-settings-refresher-training/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/safeguarding-hiring-with-confidence-safer-recruitment-for-international-settings-refresher-training/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/safeguarding-hiring-with-confidence-safer-recruitment-for-international-settings-refresher-training/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/safeguarding-hiring-with-confidence-safer-recruitment-for-international-settings-refresher-training/

CPD Sessions

Type of

Session

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Time (UK) &
Duration

Presenter

Audience

Free for Members

Non-Members:

Headteachers,
Driving and Evaluating Mondav. 26 1:30-3:30 pm (UK Senior Leaders Standard Package
School Improvement with & Short Course y. ) =UP Dr Julia Batters N ' Up to 5 members of staff
Purpose and Clarity January 2026 Time) and aspiring £555.68 + VAT
' - leaders .
Premium Package
Up to 10 members of staff
£977.04 + VAT
Sofa Conversations: @Live Costas
4 Tuesday, 3 3:30 pm - 4:00 pm _
Real Talk, Real Questions - | Broadcast y P P Constantiou & For all teachers Fr(;e”event Open
For Middle Leaders Not recorded LisaJane Ashes
Literacy 3tan5dardbPacI:ag<fef
Teaching Phonics and y Mondav. 1:30-3:30 pm (UK and phonics £p5t5°5 g;T\Z\STO e
Early Literacy Skills for & Short Course Februa)r/'y 2026 Time) Jacqueline Harris coordinators, all b Pack
(Members only) o EVES & pri remium Package
AL Learners Duration: 2 hours hool prm;ary Up to 10 members of staff
school teachers £077.04 + VAT
Never Stop Learning veema: -
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https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/driving-and-evaluating-school-improvement-with-purpose-and-clarity/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/driving-and-evaluating-school-improvement-with-purpose-and-clarity/
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https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/sofa-conversations-real-talk-real-questions-for-middle-leaders/
https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/sofa-conversations-real-talk-real-questions-for-middle-leaders/
https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/sofa-conversations-real-talk-real-questions-for-middle-leaders/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners/
https://veema.co.uk/short_courses/teaching-phonics-and-early-literacy-skills-for-eal-learners/

CPD Sessions

Type of

Session

On-
Demand
Webinar,
Videos &

Resources

Time (UK) &
Duration

Presenter

Audience

Advancing Teachers
Programme - Helping
Teachers to Thrive

9 Week
Programme

Monday 23
February, 2026

1:30-3:30 pm (UK
Time)

Duration: 2 hours

Costas
Constantiou &
LisaJane Ashes

Teachers who
have less than five
years of teaching

Members:
£422.10

(Plus one free place with
every 5 participants
booked on this course)

experience Non-Members:
£469.00
Cognitive Science for
Teachers
& 0n-Demand Video
Series (Members Only)
All teachers,

Video 1: The Science of
Learning: What Every
Teacher Should Know

Video 2: Cognitive Load in
the Classroom: Teaching
for Thinking, Not Overload

Video 3: Attention,
Engagement & the Teenage
Brain

@ Live Webinar
and On-
Demand Video

v

(Members only)

Wednesday, 25
February 2026

Costas
Constantiou &
Lisa Jane Ashes

especially ECT
Mentors, Heads
of Department,
Subject Leads, and
Lead Practitioners

Never Stop Lea
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https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/advancing-teacher-programme-helping-teachers-to-thrive/
https://veema.co.uk/upcoming-events/advancing-teacher-programme-helping-teachers-to-thrive/
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On-

Demand :
: Type of : Time (UK) & :
CPD Sessions yp : Webinar, ( : ) Presenter Audience
Session : Duration
Videos &
Resources
Free for Members
1:30 - 3:30 pm (UK For Senior Leaders, Non-Members:
DSL Update: Refresher i Designated Standard Package
i ,'D ) 4 Thursday, 5 time) Debbie ghatec U 105 members of gff
Training for International ®ishort Course March 2026 Duration: 2 hours Innes-Turnill safeguarding bes g
School Leaders (Members only) : Leads (DSLS), £555.68 + VAT
Pastoral Leaders Premium Package
Up to 10 members of staff
£977.04 + VAT
Talk That Works: )
. . Costas Senior Leaders,
Applying Transactional . ) 4 Tuesday, 10 3:30 pm - 3:45 pm ) )
A;"l;‘:ll sis to Lead Better @ Live Webinar March. 2026 (UK time) Constantiou & Middle Leaders, Free
¥ i (Members only) ' Lisa Jane Ashes and Teachers
Conversations

vecma -
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